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Against the beautiful and wild backdrop of the Rocky Mountains comes this sweeping saga of romance,
betrayal, and forgiveness.

A Heart Divided

When fate brings them together, they must choose between family ties and love.
The Caldwells and Wainwrights have been feuding for decades. Still, Sarah Caldwell realizes things have
gone too far when her father tricks her into swindling Cord Wainwright, heir of the Wainwright holdings. As
the feud boils over, Cord and Sarah make a most inconvenient discovery--they just might be falling in love.

A Love Forbidden

They're from two different worlds. Can love cross the divide?
Shiloh Wainwright is eager to use her teaching skills to help improve the lives of Ute Indian children of the
Colorado frontier. But she soon finds herself caught in the cross fire between the Utes, their unyielding
Indian agent, and a demanding US government. Her unexpected encounter with a half-Ute childhood friend,
Jesse Blackwater, only complicates matters as they battle their growing feelings for each other amidst
spiraling tensions that threaten to explode into a catastrophic uprising.

Praise for the Heart of the Rockies series

"Exceptional! Morgan's lyrical prose paints a vivid picture of life in the Rockies."--Amanda Cabot,
bestselling author of At Bluebonnet Lake

"Be still my heart--Kathleen Morgan is back, and she's better than ever!"--Julie Lessman, award-winning
author of The Daughters of Boston, Winds of Change, and The Heart of San Francisco series

"A thoroughly enjoyable romance set in the magnificent Colorado Rockies!"--Maggie Brendan, bestselling
author of the Heart of the West and Blue Willow Brides series

Kathleen Morgan is the award-winning author of many novels, including the bestselling Brides of Culdee
Creek series.
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From reader reviews:

Stan Whitley:

This book untitled Heart of the Rockies Collection: 2-in-1 to be one of several books this best seller in this
year, that is because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this
specific book in the book shop or you can order it by using online. The publisher on this book sells the e-
book too. It makes you easier to read this book, as you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no
reason for you to past this reserve from your list.

Kenneth Williams:

This Heart of the Rockies Collection: 2-in-1 is great e-book for you because the content which is full of
information for you who else always deal with world and still have to make decision every minute. This
particular book reveal it data accurately using great plan word or we can state no rambling sentences within
it. So if you are read that hurriedly you can have whole information in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you
with straight forward sentences but tough core information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having
Heart of the Rockies Collection: 2-in-1 in your hand like getting the world in your arm, data in it is not
ridiculous just one. We can say that no book that offer you world with ten or fifteen tiny right but this
publication already do that. So , this really is good reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still
doubt that?

Mark Hernandez:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our understanding for everything. By a publication we can
know everything we want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year
was exactly added. This publication Heart of the Rockies Collection: 2-in-1 was filled with regards to
science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has distinct
feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can experience
enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book that you just wanted.

Sherman Etheridge:

A number of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a book. They are directly felt this when
they get a half regions of the book. You can choose the actual book Heart of the Rockies Collection: 2-in-1
to make your current reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading proficiency is developing when you
like reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the sensation
about book and reading through especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to available a book and
examine it. Beside that the e-book Heart of the Rockies Collection: 2-in-1 can to be a newly purchased friend
when you're really feel alone and confuse with what must you're doing of that time.
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