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Proper analysis of image and multimedia data requires efficient extraction and segmentation techniques.
Among the many computational intelligence approaches, the soft computing paradigm is best equipped with
several tools and techniques that incorporate intelligent concepts and principles. This book is dedicated to
object extraction, image segmentation, and edge detection using soft computing techniques with extensive
real-life application to image and multimedia data.

 

The authors start with a comprehensive tutorial on the basics of brain structure and learning, and then the key
soft computing techniques, including evolutionary computation, neural networks, fuzzy sets and fuzzy logic,
and rough sets. They then present seven chapters that detail the application of representative techniques to
complex image processing tasks such as image recognition, lighting control, target tracking, object
extraction, and edge detection. These chapters follow a structured approach with detailed explanations of the
problems, solutions, results, and conclusions.

 

This is both a standalone textbook for graduates in computer science, electrical engineering, system science,
and information technology, and a reference for researchers and engineers engaged with pattern recognition,
image processing, and soft computing.
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From reader reviews:

Johnny Cervantes:

Typically the book Soft Computing for Image and Multimedia Data Processing has a lot details on it. So
when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was written by the very famous
author. The writer makes some research just before write this book. That book very easy to read you can
obtain the point easily after looking over this book.

Blanche Watson:

In this era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more important than
other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time not much but quite enough to possess a look at some books. On the list of books in the
top collection in your reading list is definitely Soft Computing for Image and Multimedia Data Processing.
This book which can be qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in becoming precious person.
By looking upward and review this reserve you can get many advantages.

Robert Wallace:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got pupils? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. So you know that
little person just like reading or as studying become their hobby. You must know that reading is very
important and book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to include you knowledge, except your own
personal teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update about something by book. Many kinds of books
that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is Soft Computing for Image and Multimedia Data
Processing.

Brian Paige:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is composed or printed or descriptive from each source that will filled update of
news. On this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media
social similar to newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
seeking the Soft Computing for Image and Multimedia Data Processing when you necessary it?
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