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Enriched Classics offer readers accessible editions of great works of literature enhanced by helpful notes and
commentary. Each book includes educational tools alongside the text, enabling students and readers alike to
gain a deeper and more developed understanding of the writer and their work.

Left blind, deaf, and mute after an illness in infancy, Helen Keller overcame her disabilities with the help of
Anne Sullivan, her inspired teacher. Her classic autobiography, first published in 1903, covers her first
twenty-two years, including the memorable moment at a water pump when she first made the connection
between the word “water” and the cold liquid flowing over her hand. She also discusses her friendships with
Oliver Wendell Holmes and other notables, her education at Radcliffe, her joy at learning to speak, and
above all, her extraordinary relationship with her teacher. This deeply moving memoir, full of love and
compassion for others, offers an unforgettable portrait of one of the twentieth century’s most remarkable
women.

Enriched Classics enhance your engagement by introducing and explaining the historical and cultural
significance of the work, the author’s personal history, and what impact this book had on subsequent
scholarship. Each book includes discussion questions that help clarify and reinforce major themes and
reading recommendations for further research.

Read with confidence.
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From reader reviews:

Larry Young:

The Story of My Life (Enriched Classics) can be one of your starter books that are good idea. All of us
recommend that straight away because this publication has good vocabulary that can increase your
knowledge in words, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The
article author giving his/her effort to set every word into enjoyment arrangement in writing The Story of My
Life (Enriched Classics) yet doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest and based confirm
resource info that maybe you can be one of it. This great information may drawn you into completely new
stage of crucial pondering.

Carol Reck:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Aim to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't assess book by its include may doesn't
work at this point is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in
the outside look likes. Maybe you answer can be The Story of My Life (Enriched Classics) why because the
excellent cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or
content will be fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly assist you to
pick up this book.

William Oden:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make anyone to
understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information easier to share.
You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You will
observe that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The actual book that recommended
for your requirements is The Story of My Life (Enriched Classics) this e-book consist a lot of the
information of the condition of this world now. This book was represented just how can the world has grown
up. The terminology styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer
made some analysis when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book acceptable all of you.

Thanh Johnson:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside with friends, fun activity together with family or
just watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by reading a book. Ugh,
ya think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It alright you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like The Story of My Life (Enriched
Classics) which is obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's find.
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