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Trial by jury is not a fundamental part of the Japanese legal system, but there has been a recent important
move towards this with the introduction in 2009 of the lay assessor system whereby lay people sit with
judges in criminal trials. This book considers the debates in Japan which surround this development. It
examines the political and socio-legal contexts, contrasting the view that the participation of ordinary
citizens in criminal trials is an important manifestation of democracy, with the view that Japan as a society
where authority is highly venerated is not natural territory for a system where lay people are likely to express
views at odds with expert judges. It discusses Japan’s earlier experiments with jury trials in the late 19th

Century, the period 1923-43, and up to 1970 in US-controlled Okinawa, compares developing views in Japan
on this issue with views in other countries, where dissatisfaction with the jury system is often evident, and
concludes by assessing how the new system in Japan is working out and how it is likely to develop.
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From reader reviews:

Harriett Costello:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. As we
know that book is very important for us. The book Juries in the Japanese Legal System: The Continuing
Struggle for Citizen Participation and Democracy (Routledge Law in Asia) has been making you to know
about other expertise and of course you can take more information. It is very advantages for you. The
publication Juries in the Japanese Legal System: The Continuing Struggle for Citizen Participation and
Democracy (Routledge Law in Asia) is not only giving you much more new information but also to become
your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your
publication. Try to make relationship together with the book Juries in the Japanese Legal System: The
Continuing Struggle for Citizen Participation and Democracy (Routledge Law in Asia). You never feel lose
out for everything when you read some books.

Grace Harrell:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information today can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider any time those information which is inside former life are challenging to be find than now's taking
seriously which one would work to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you get the unstable
resource then you have it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Juries in the Japanese Legal System: The Continuing
Struggle for Citizen Participation and Democracy (Routledge Law in Asia) as your daily resource
information.

Alfonso Unruh:

Do you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Make an effort to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't evaluate book by its protect
may doesn't work at this point is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since
fantastic as in the outside seem likes. Maybe you answer can be Juries in the Japanese Legal System: The
Continuing Struggle for Citizen Participation and Democracy (Routledge Law in Asia) why because the
wonderful cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint you actually. The
inside or content is fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly make
suggestions to pick up this book.

Deanna Thompson:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you could have it
in e-book method, more simple and reachable. This specific Juries in the Japanese Legal System: The
Continuing Struggle for Citizen Participation and Democracy (Routledge Law in Asia) can give you a lot of



buddies because by you considering this one book you have thing that they don't and make a person more
like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of a step for you to get success. This guide offer
you information that probably your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than different make you to be
great persons. So , why hesitate? Let us have Juries in the Japanese Legal System: The Continuing Struggle
for Citizen Participation and Democracy (Routledge Law in Asia).
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