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Community organizing became an integral part of the activist repertoire of the New Left in the 1960s.
Students for a Democratic Society, the organization that came to be seen as synonymous with the white New
Left, began community organizing in 1963, hoping to build an interracial movement of the poor through
which to demand social and political change. SDS sought nothing less than to abolish poverty and extend
democratic participation in America.

Over the next five years, organizers established a strong presence in numerous low-income, racially diverse
urban neighborhoods in Chicago, Cleveland, Newark, and Boston, as well as other cities. Rejecting the
strategies of the old left and labor movement and inspired by the Civil Rights Movement, activists sought to
combine a number of single issues into a broader, more powerful coalition. Organizers never limited
themselves to today's simple dichotomies of race vs. class or of identity politics vs. economic inequality.
They actively synthesized emerging identity politics with class and coalition politics and with a drive for a
more participatory welfare state, treating these diverse political approaches as inextricably intertwined.
While common wisdom holds that the New Left rejected all state involvement as cooptative at best, Jennifer
Frost traces the ways in which New Left and community activists did in fact put forward a prescriptive, even
visionary, alternative to the welfare state.

After Students for a Democratic Society and its community organizing unit, the Economic Research and
Action Project, disbanded, New Left and community participants went on to apply their strategies and goals
to the welfare rights, women’s liberation, and the antiwar movements. In her study of activism before the age
of identity politics, Frost has given us the first full-fledged history of what was arguably the most innovative
community organizing campaign in post-war American history.
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From reader reviews:

Eunice Bosse:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take
a wander, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book titled An Interracial
Movement of the Poor: Community Organizing and the New Left in the 1960s? Maybe it is to become best
activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can wiser
than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have other opinion?

Molly Edwards:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be change about what going on or data even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era and that is always change and progress. Some of you
maybe may update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems
coming to an individual is you don't know what type you should start with. This An Interracial Movement of
the Poor: Community Organizing and the New Left in the 1960s is our recommendation to cause you to keep
up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Donna Gamble:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This
reading behavior give you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the
information inside the book which improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on
what kind of reserve you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with education books but if you want
sense happy read one with theme for entertaining like comic or novel. The particular An Interracial
Movement of the Poor: Community Organizing and the New Left in the 1960s is kind of publication which
is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Mark Smith:

The e-book with title An Interracial Movement of the Poor: Community Organizing and the New Left in the
1960s contains a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This
kind of book exist new know-how the information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the
world at this point. That is important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. That book
will bring you in new era of the internationalization. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you
can read it anywhere you want.
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