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Security practitioners must be able to build cost-effective security programs while also complying with
government regulations. Information Security Governance Simplified: From the Boardroom to the
Keyboard lays out these regulations in simple terms and explains how to use control frameworks to build an
air-tight information security (IS) program and governance structure.

Defining the leadership skills required by IS officers, the book examines the pros and cons of different
reporting structures and highlights the various control frameworks available. It details the functions of the
security department and considers the control areas, including physical, network, application, business
continuity/disaster recover, and identity management.

Todd Fitzgerald explains how to establish a solid foundation for building your security program and shares
time-tested insights about what works and what doesn’t when building an IS program. Highlighting security
considerations for managerial, technical, and operational controls, it provides helpful tips for selling your
program to management. It also includes tools to help you create a workable IS charter and your own IS
policies. Based on proven experience rather than theory, the book gives you the tools and real-world insight
needed to secure your information while ensuring compliance with government regulations.
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From reader reviews:

Nancy Tandy:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you can
add your knowledge by the book entitled Information Security Governance Simplified: From the Boardroom
to the Keyboard. Try to make the book Information Security Governance Simplified: From the Boardroom to
the Keyboard as your good friend. It means that it can being your friend when you experience alone and
beside that of course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you
far more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , let us make new experience and also
knowledge with this book.

William Stewart:

Now a day those who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by connect with the internet and
the resources within it can be true or not require people to be aware of each details they get. How people
have to be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Looking at a
book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Information Security Governance
Simplified: From the Boardroom to the Keyboard book as this book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of
course the information in this book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Clement Williams:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book mainly book
entitled Information Security Governance Simplified: From the Boardroom to the Keyboard your brain will
drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each and every aspect that maybe unknown for but surely
might be your mind friends. Imaging every word written in a publication then become one form conclusion
and explanation this maybe you never get ahead of. The Information Security Governance Simplified: From
the Boardroom to the Keyboard giving you yet another experience more than blown away the mind but also
giving you useful facts for your better life in this particular era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing
pattern here is your body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning a
game. Do you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Mathew Casillas:

A lot of publication has printed but it is unique. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the
top book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is identified as of book
Information Security Governance Simplified: From the Boardroom to the Keyboard. You can include your
knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make an individual
happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one destination to
other place.
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