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Chess has fascinated people for centuries. There is evidence that a very similar game was played in the 6th
and 7th centuries. It probably originated in India, spread to Persia, and thence to the Levant. By the 13th
century that game was played all over the continent. The modern game dates from the 1400s. The story of
this wonderful game is told by Colleen Schafroth, director of the Maryhill Museum of Art in Goldendale,
Washington, which owns a famous collection of chess pieces and sets. She tells her story in an easy and
colorful style, illustrating it with pictures of historic and beautiful chess men from an international array of
sources. There are pieces that were made in India and Russia, Bali and ancient Persia, Italy and Egypt,
England and France. Both Napoleon and Nelson's ivory sets are illustrated. Besides the chess pieces
themselves, there are exquisite objects and illuminated manuscripts and paintings depicting chess games in
progress. This is a wonderful combination of text and pictures that will appeal to any chess player and to all
dealers and collectors of chess pieces and related art.
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From reader reviews:

Ralph Garibay:

The book untitled The Art of Chess is the publication that recommended to you to read. You can see the
quality of the e-book content that will be shown to an individual. The language that publisher use to
explained their ideas are easily to understand. The author was did a lot of analysis when write the book, to
ensure the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of The
Art of Chess from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Lauren Graves:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to pick book like comic,
short story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not striving The Art of Chess that give your fun
preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading addiction all over the world can be said as the
way for people to know world far better then how they react toward the world. It can't be said constantly that
reading behavior only for the geeky individual but for all of you who wants to end up being success person.
So , for all of you who want to start looking at as your good habit, it is possible to pick The Art of Chess
become your current starter.

Jared Smith:

A lot of publication has printed but it differs. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the most
effective book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is known as of
book The Art of Chess. You can add your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it may add
your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most essential that, you must aware about guide.
It can bring you from one destination for a other place.

Robbie Lewis:

E-book is one of source of know-how. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen want book to know the change information of year for you to year. As we know
those guides have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world.
By book The Art of Chess we can have more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? Being
creative person must like to read a book. Merely choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't end
up being doubt to change your life by this book The Art of Chess. You can more inviting than now.
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