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In 1938, Helen Ricks sailed off on a freighter to experience a part of the world that was so very different
from her life in Virginia. Helen wrote of her adventures in a journal and years after her death, this journal
was found by Helen Sablan, Ms. Ricks' great niece. As Helen read the words, she became inspired to trace
the footsteps that were so vividly described and write of her own adventures.From Samuel Pepys' diaries of
the 1600's to Isak Dinesen's memoirs in Out of Africa first published in 1937, to the more recent Under the
Tuscan Sun by Frances Mayes, readers have been interested in the true life experiences of people especially
those that involve travel and fulfillment of dreams.There are many travel books on bookstore and library
shelves that feature cultural aspects of countries and cities. These are the books we buy before embarking on
a trip to a foreign land. There are books on travel journaling, solo travel, modern women travelers, early day
women travelers, and freighter travel; however, there is no book on the shelves that combines all of these
aspects. Devotedly Dixie: Travel Journals of Two Helens has it all.
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From reader reviews:

Daniel Smith:

What do you consider book? It is just for students since they're still students or it for all people in the world,
exactly what the best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
several personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that
they don't desire do that. You must know how great along with important the book Devotedly Dixie: Travel
Journals of Two Helens. All type of book can you see on many options. You can look for the internet
solutions or other social media.

Fatima Leonard:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information currently can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider any time those information which is within the former life are challenging be find than now's taking
seriously which one works to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable
resource then you obtain it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All of those
possibilities will not happen with you if you take Devotedly Dixie: Travel Journals of Two Helens as the
daily resource information.

Joann Huertas:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their free time with their family, or their
particular friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic within
the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to fill
your free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book can be option to fill your free of charge time/ holiday. The
first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to consider look for
book, may be the reserve untitled Devotedly Dixie: Travel Journals of Two Helens can be very good book to
read. May be it may be best activity to you.

Kimberly Hutton:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book specially book
entitled Devotedly Dixie: Travel Journals of Two Helens your head will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in each aspect that maybe mysterious for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging every
word written in a book then become one type conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get
before. The Devotedly Dixie: Travel Journals of Two Helens giving you another experience more than
blown away the mind but also giving you useful info for your better life on this era. So now let us teach you
the relaxing pattern the following is your body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished
looking at it, like winning a. Do you want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?
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