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The only Bolshevik leader to write his memoirs, Leon Trotsky published this remarkable book in 1930, the
first year of a perilous, decade-long exile that ended with his assassination in Mexico. Expelled from the
Communist party and deported from the Soviet Union, the former People's Commissar for Foreign Affairs
recalled his lifelong struggle in the world of revolutionary politics. In addition to his firsthand accounts of
the early intrigues within the Communist government, Trotsky also delivered chilling glimpses into the rise
of the new Soviet bureaucracy and prescient warnings of the Stalinist regime's horrors.
My Life recounts the rise of the revolutionary wave in Russia in 1905 and 1917, the devastating effects of
World War I, and the degeneration of the Russian Revolution from Lenin's internationalist course to Stalin's
increasingly counterrevolutionary policies. Trotsky's exile placed him beyond the pale of both the official
Communist party and the rest of the political world; yet in this fascinating historical document, he remains
true to a philosophy of permanent world revolution, offering a highly informed perspective on the struggle
toward a socialist future.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Ehlers:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem;
you can add your knowledge by the e-book entitled My Life: An Attempt at an Autobiography (Dover Value
Editions). Try to the actual book My Life: An Attempt at an Autobiography (Dover Value Editions) as your
good friend. It means that it can for being your friend when you experience alone and beside that course
make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you
considerably more confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , let's make new
experience and knowledge with this book.

Ellen Weiss:

In other case, little people like to read book My Life: An Attempt at an Autobiography (Dover Value
Editions). You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. Provided that we know about how is
important a book My Life: An Attempt at an Autobiography (Dover Value Editions). You can add know-
how and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, since from book you can learn
everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About simple thing until
wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we are able to open a book as well as searching by internet
unit. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's read.

Mary Fix:

The guide untitled My Life: An Attempt at an Autobiography (Dover Value Editions) is the book that
recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to you
actually. The language that creator use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The copy writer was
did a lot of research when write the book, hence the information that they share to you personally is
absolutely accurate. You also could possibly get the e-book of My Life: An Attempt at an Autobiography
(Dover Value Editions) from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Kelley Hardy:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray an individual, why because this My Life: An Attempt at an
Autobiography (Dover Value Editions) e-book written by well-known writer who knows well how to make
book that could be understand by anyone who read the book. Written with good manner for you, still
dripping wet every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your hunger then you still doubt My Life:
An Attempt at an Autobiography (Dover Value Editions) as good book not only by the cover but also by
content. This is one reserve that can break don't assess book by its deal with, so do you still needing another
sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already said so why you have to
listening to a different sixth sense.
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