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Hinton Rowan Helper (1829–1909) gained notoriety in nineteenth-century America as the author of The
Impending Crisis of the South (1857), an antislavery polemic that provoked national public controversy and
increased sectional tensions. In his intellectual and cultural biography of Helper—the first to appear in more
than forty years—David Brown provides a fresh and nuanced portrait of this self-styled reformer, exploring
anew Helper's motivation for writing his inflammatory book.

Brown places Helper in a perspective that shows how the society in which he lived influenced his thinking,
beginning with Helper's upbringing in North Carolina, his move to California at the height of the Californian
gold rush, his developing hostility toward nonwhites within the United States, and his publication of The
Impending Crisis of the South. Helper's book paints a picture of a region dragged down by the institution of
slavery and displays surprising concern for the fate of American slaves. It sold 140,000 copies, perhaps
rivaled only by Uncle Tom's Cabin in its impact. The author argues that Helper never wavered in his
commitment to the South, though his book's devastating critique made him an outcast there, playing a crucial
role in the election of Lincoln and influencing the outbreak of war.

As his career progressed after the war, Helper's racial attitudes grew increasingly intolerant. He became
involved in various grand pursuits, including a plan to link North and South America by rail, continually
seeking a success that would match his earlier fame. But after a series of disappointments, he finally
committed suicide.

Brown reconsiders the life and career of one of the antebellum South's most controversial and misunderstood
figures. Helper was also one of the rare lower-class whites who recorded in detail his economic, political,
and social views, thus affording a valuable window into the world of nonslaveholding white southerners on
the eve of the Civil War. His critique of slavery provides an important challenge to dominant paradigms
stressing consensus among southern whites, and his development into a racist illustrates the power and
destructiveness of the prejudice that took hold of the South in the late nineteenth century, as well as the
wider developments in American society at the time.
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Spangler:

The feeling that you get from Southern Outcast: Hinton Rowan Helper and The Impending Crisis of the
South (Southern Biography Series) may be the more deep you looking the information that hide inside the
words the more you get considering reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to comprehend but
Southern Outcast: Hinton Rowan Helper and The Impending Crisis of the South (Southern Biography Series)
giving you thrill feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in a number of way that can be
understood by simply anyone who read it because the author of this publication is well-known enough. This
kind of book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can go
together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for having this specific
Southern Outcast: Hinton Rowan Helper and The Impending Crisis of the South (Southern Biography Series)
instantly.

Myron Abbott:

Southern Outcast: Hinton Rowan Helper and The Impending Crisis of the South (Southern Biography Series)
can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. We recommend that straight away because this guide
has good vocabulary that may increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still
delivering the information. The copy writer giving his/her effort that will put every word into delight
arrangement in writing Southern Outcast: Hinton Rowan Helper and The Impending Crisis of the South
(Southern Biography Series) however doesn't forget the main place, giving the reader the hottest in addition
to based confirm resource data that maybe you can be one of it. This great information can certainly drawn
you into new stage of crucial contemplating.

Stephen Thrush:

This Southern Outcast: Hinton Rowan Helper and The Impending Crisis of the South (Southern Biography
Series) is great book for you because the content that is certainly full of information for you who also always
deal with world and get to make decision every minute. That book reveal it details accurately using great
organize word or we can say no rambling sentences within it. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have
whole information in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight forward sentences but tricky core
information with lovely delivering sentences. Having Southern Outcast: Hinton Rowan Helper and The
Impending Crisis of the South (Southern Biography Series) in your hand like finding the world in your arm,
facts in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that no book that offer you world in ten or fifteen tiny right but
this book already do that. So , it is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt in which?

Regina Nichols:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library in
order to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's heart and



soul or real their pastime. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the library. They go to
there but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring along with can't
see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we
know that on this era, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore this Southern Outcast: Hinton Rowan Helper and The Impending Crisis of the
South (Southern Biography Series) can make you sense more interested to read.
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