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A beautifully illustrated and poignant graphic memoir that tells the story of World War II from an
Everyman's perspective.
 
In March of 1943, Scott Chantler's grandfather, Law Chantler, shipped out across the Atlantic for active
service with the Highland Light Infantry of Canada, along with his best friend, Jack, a fellow officer. Not
long afterward, they would find themselves making a rocky crossing of the English Channel, about to take
part in one of the most pivotal and treacherous military operations of World War II: the Allied invasion of
Normandy. Two Generals tells the story of what happened there through the eyes of these two young men --
not the celebrated military commanders or politicians we often hear about, but everyday heroes who risked
their lives for the Allied cause. Meticulously researched and gorgeously illustrated, Two Generals is a
harrowing story of battle and a touching story of friendship -- and a vital and vibrant record of unsung
heroism.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

George Harvey:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to learn everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim as well as goal; it means that
book has different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They are really
reading whatever they acquire because their hobby is reading a book. How about the person who don't like
examining a book? Sometime, individual feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or perhaps
exercise. Well, probably you will want this Two Generals.

Randall Barbee:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information currently can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even restricted. What people must be
consider while those information which is from the former life are hard to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one works to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you receive the
unstable resource then you buy it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen with you if you take Two Generals as your daily resource information.

Karen Martinez:

In this particular era which is the greater particular person or who has ability in doing something more are
more special than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What
you need to do is just spending your time very little but quite enough to have a look at some books. On the
list of books in the top checklist in your reading list is actually Two Generals. This book which can be
qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking way
up and review this reserve you can get many advantages.

James Ensor:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year was exactly
added. This book Two Generals was filled regarding science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge
about your science competence. Some people has various feel when they reading a new book. If you know
how big good thing about a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like currently,
many ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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