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Born into a famous family of artists, Pierre Matisse grew up immersed in the artistic life of Paris and the
French Riviera, spending time with some of the most famous artists of the 20th century, including Pablo
Picasso and Salvador Dali. The man he knew as his grandfather, legendary artist Henri Matisse, gave him his
first painting lesson and a strong desire to become a great artist in his own right.

Being a Matisse was an important part of young Pierre’s identity. So he was crushed and bewildered when,
at the outbreak of WWII, his mother suddenly announced to her 12-year-old son, “You are no longer a
Matisse.” With no explanation, she changed her son’s name and sent him away.

So began Pierre’s lifelong search to solve the mystery of his true identity. What had happened? Why had his
family seemingly rejected him? Who was his real father? Those questions are the intriguing backdrop to this
memoir of Pierre’s fascinating and adventurous life on three continents. Spanning the insider art world of
1930s Paris, the battles of WWII, the occupation of France by the Nazis, Pierre’s involvement with the
French resistance, his post-war work restoring art and historical monuments, and his eventual decision to
create a new life in North America, The Missing Matisse is a story of intrigue, faith, and drama as one man
journeys to discover the truth about who he is—before it’s too late.
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From reader reviews:

Sheila Lefevre:

Often the book The Missing Matisse: A Memoir will bring you to definitely the new experience of reading a
new book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book to read, this
book very suited to you. The book The Missing Matisse: A Memoir is much recommended to you to learn.
You can also get the e-book through the official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Garland Thorpe:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try thing that really opposite
from that. Just one activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love The Missing Matisse: A Memoir, you
could enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can
occur its mind hangout people. What? Still don't obtain it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Bette Morgan:

You can spend your free time to study this book this e-book. This The Missing Matisse: A Memoir is simple
to create you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not get much space to
bring the actual printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can
save the book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this
book.

Michael Castillo:

You can find this The Missing Matisse: A Memoir by check out the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing
or reviewing it might to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this e-book
are various. Not only by means of written or printed but can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the
modern era similar to now, you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right
now, choose your own personal ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most important to
arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose proper ways for you.
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