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So you want to turn your Yugo into a Viper? Sorry--you need a certified magician. But if you want to turn
your sedate sedan into a mean machine or your used car lot deal into a powerful, purring set of wheels,
you’ve come to the right place. Car Hacks & Mods for Dummies will get you turbo-charged up about
modifying your car and guide you smoothly through:

Choosing a car to mod●

Considering warranties, legal, and safety issues●

Hacking the ECU (Engine Control Unit) to adjust performance-enhancing factors like fuel injection, firing●

the spark plugs, controlling the cooling fan, and more
Replacing your ECU with a plug and play system such as the APEXi Power FC or the AEM EMS system●

Putting on the brakes (the faster you go, the faster you’ll need to stop)●

Setting up your car for better handling and cornering●

Written by David Vespremi, automotive expert, frequent guest on national car-related TV shows, track
driving instructor and self-proclaimed modder, Car Hacks & Mods for Dummies gets you into the ECU and
under the hood and gives you the keys to:

Choosing new wheels, including everything from the basics to dubs and spinners●

Putting your car on a diet, because lighter means faster●

Basic power bolt-ons and more expensive power adders●

Installing roll bars and cages to enhance safety●

Adding aero add-ons, including front “chin” spoilers, real spoilers, side skirts, and canards●

Detailing, down to the best cleaners and waxes and cleaning under the hood●

Using OBD (on-board diagnostics) for troubleshooting●

Getting advice from general Internet sites and specific message boards and forums for your car’s make or●

model, whether it’s a Chevy pick-up or an Alfa Romeo roadster

Whether you want to compete at drag strips or on road courses or simply accelerate faster on an interstate
ramp, if you want to improve your car’s performance, Car Hacks & Mods for Dummies is just the boost you
need.
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From reader reviews:

Dan Maes:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you can
add your knowledge by the publication entitled Car Hacks and Mods For Dummies. Try to face the book Car
Hacks and Mods For Dummies as your friend. It means that it can to be your friend when you really feel
alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit
your needs. The book makes you much more confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So ,
let's make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Gary Ackley:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading practice give you
lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the
book in which improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of book you
read, if you want send more knowledge just go with training books but if you want sense happy read one
together with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The actual Car Hacks and Mods For
Dummies is kind of publication which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Clarence Cobb:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book especially book entitled Car
Hacks and Mods For Dummies your mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect
that maybe unfamiliar for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging every word written in a reserve
then become one form conclusion and explanation which maybe you never get just before. The Car Hacks
and Mods For Dummies giving you a different experience more than blown away the mind but also giving
you useful data for your better life in this particular era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern here is
your body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning a. Do you want
to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Cora Snyder:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This particular book Car Hacks and Mods For Dummies was multi-
colored and of course has pictures around. As we know that book Car Hacks and Mods For Dummies has
many kinds or type. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and
think that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it
makes you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading that.
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