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This first study in English of the reign of Alfonso XII and the creation of a quasi-parliamentary monarchy
revises the previously held estimate of the leadership of the frail young king, removing him from the shadow
of his minister, the pragmatic Antonio Cánovas del Castillo, whom Spanish historians have credited with the
accomplishments of the reign of Alfonso.
 
Turning to the diplomatic reports of German, British, and American envoys, Beck, an established German
historian, shows that Alfonso and Cánovas worked together as a team and that their “triumphs”—the
reestablishment of Spain’s royal family, the adoption of the constitution which was to survive until 1931, and
the stabilizing of an alliance of military factions into a nation—were offset by their “sorrows”—the complex
factors of the king’s ill health, the weight of tradition, national decline, and floods, earthquakes, and cholera,
which were too great for human leaders to overcome.
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From reader reviews:

Roy Myers:

The book A Time of Triumph and Sorrow: Spanish Politics During the Reign of Alfonso XII, 1874-1885
make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make your capable far more increase. Book can
to become your best friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem along with your subject. If you
can make reading a book A Time of Triumph and Sorrow: Spanish Politics During the Reign of Alfonso XII,
1874-1885 to be your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your current capable,
increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. You may know everything if you like open up and read
a book A Time of Triumph and Sorrow: Spanish Politics During the Reign of Alfonso XII, 1874-1885. Kinds
of book are several. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think
about this publication?

Stephen Williams:

A Time of Triumph and Sorrow: Spanish Politics During the Reign of Alfonso XII, 1874-1885 can be one of
your beginner books that are good idea. Many of us recommend that straight away because this reserve has
good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but
nevertheless delivering the information. The writer giving his/her effort to set every word into satisfaction
arrangement in writing A Time of Triumph and Sorrow: Spanish Politics During the Reign of Alfonso XII,
1874-1885 nevertheless doesn't forget the main place, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm
resource info that maybe you can be among it. This great information could drawn you into completely new
stage of crucial thinking.

Nicole Norris:

This A Time of Triumph and Sorrow: Spanish Politics During the Reign of Alfonso XII, 1874-1885 is great
e-book for you because the content which can be full of information for you who also always deal with world
and have to make decision every minute. That book reveal it info accurately using great organize word or we
can point out no rambling sentences within it. So if you are read that hurriedly you can have whole facts in it.
Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but hard core information with wonderful
delivering sentences. Having A Time of Triumph and Sorrow: Spanish Politics During the Reign of Alfonso
XII, 1874-1885 in your hand like getting the world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that
no reserve that offer you world in ten or fifteen tiny right but this book already do that. So , this is good
reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt in which?

Natalia Burton:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside together with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading through a book.
Ugh, do you think reading a book will surely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It alright



you can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like A Time of
Triumph and Sorrow: Spanish Politics During the Reign of Alfonso XII, 1874-1885 which is finding the e-
book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's notice.
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